
Send Neighbourhood Area consultation

Respondent
Organisation

Comment Officer's response

I fully support the Send Neighbourhood Area request submitted by Send Parish Council as it enables greater local
inclusion and accountability.

Your support is noted.

I support the Send Parish as a suitable aread for Neighbourhood Planning. Your support is noted.

I fully support this initiative. I believe it is important for local residents to have their views taken into account
regarding planning matters.

Your support is noted.

I agree that the proposed Send Neighbourhood plan area is an appropriate area which reflects the Send Parish
Council area

Your support is noted.

I consider that Send is an appropriate village to be designated as suitable for a Neighbourhood Plan and I would
like to see one prepared and submitted.

[Name redacted]

Your support is noted.
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I consider that Send has a cohesive village community and established boundaries and as such it is appropriate for
it to have its own Neighbourhood Plan to have a say in its future development.

[Name and address redacted]

Your support is noted.

I am writing to support the designation of the Parish of Send as a neighbourhood plan area. I would like to see the
neighbourhood plan ensure that the Parish of Send remains as a semi-rural village and within the Green Belt.

Your support it noted.

I wish to support this application by Send Parish Council as I believe that it will help the parish and Guildford
Borough Council in its preparation of the new Local Plan. As you are only too aware, last year's proposed Local
Plan met with massive opposition in Send, and I do believe that Send Parish being designated as a Neighbourhood
Area will contribute greatly to the making of sensible and acceptable provision for new housing within the Parish,
and within the Local Plan.

Your support is noted.

I would like to support the application for a Send Neighbourhood Plan covering the area of the existing Send
parish.

Your support is noted.

As a long-term resident of Send, I fully support the proposal to create a Neighbourhood Plan for Send and the
request to Guildford Borough Council to designate Send as a Neighbourhood Area. Our village has a strong,
unique community spirit and identity, as evidenced by the numerous community organisations and activities in
Send itself , all contributing to the special characteristics of our village, which therefore deserves to be granted the
status of being a Neighbourhood Area

Your support is noted.

Astenbell Ltd
I feel the Send neighbourhood area and statements submitted are accurate and appropriate. Your support is noted.
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I am very happy for this consultation to take place. The Neighbourhood plan will enable the Villagers to express
their choices and needs for the future.

Your support is noted.

Dear sirs

The issue of Send Parish Council's application to become a Neighbourhood Area was raised at the recent AGM of
the Boughton Hall Avenue Residents' Association.

It seems clear that the interests and wishes of Send's people are best managed by responsible people who live and
work in Send. So, I hereby vote in their favour.

Your support is noted.

I support this proposal. Your support is noted.

I support Send Parish Council's application for designation as a Neighbourhood Area since it will aid holostic
planning for the Parish

Your support is noted.
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